

1. Between 2018 and 2021 what percent of those referred to your eating disorder service are refused access? (adult and children)
All eating disorder referrals are offered assessment and treatment as appropriate
2. 2018 and 2021 what level of severity of illness are you commissioned to treat in eating disorder services for adults and children? E.g. can treat severe eating disorders, not very severe/moderate
Health services in Dumfries and Galloway are not commissioned as they are in England. Both adult and children's services would assess and treat as appropriate any person referred with a potential eating disorder.
3. Between 2018 and 2021 was your admission policy for children's eating disorder services based on a patient's BMI, or other factors (such as amount of purging? Their demographic)?
Dumfries and Galloway CAMHS do not use BMI calculation for children. CAMHS use weight for height calculation and only admit as absolutely necessary.
4. Between 2018 and 2021 was your admission policy for adult's eating disorder services based on a patient's BMI, or other factors (such as amount of purging? Their demographic)?
For adult services the policy for admission is based on risk assessment, BMI, Increased eating disorder behaviours, the speed of weight loss, if the person is pregnant, breast feeding, or has diabetes, physical observations - bloods, ECG, BP, pulse, temperature and cognitive assessment.
5. Currently how long is your waiting list (priority and normal) for adult patients to access eating disorder treatment? (as of September 2020-Jan 2021)
For adult services there is a 12 month waiting list for psychology, there is less than 5 on the waiting list for SEDS input but currently being supported by the CMHT.
6. Currently how long is your waiting list (priority and normal) for children patients to access eating disorder treatment? (as of September 2020 - Jan 2021)
Any referral for eating disorders are prioritised as urgent by Dumfries and Galloway CAMHS, therefore offered assessment within 48 working hours.
7. In your trust how many people have made appointments at CAMHS in the last 8 weeks to discuss an eating disorder?
This information is not held in a reportable format; therefore this request is refused under section 17 of FOISA.
8. In your trust how many people have made appointments for adult services in the last 8 weeks to discuss an eating disorder?
22 people.
9. Between 2018 and 2021 what was your rate of relapse for CAMHS eating disorder services i.e. what percentage of your patients who are discharged from treatment return and are readmitted?
This information is not held in a reportable format; therefore this request is refused under section 17 of FOISA.

10. Between 2018 and 2021 what was your rate of relapse for adult eating disorder services i.e. what percentage of your patients who are discharged from treatment return and are readmitted?

Number of discharges in period	24
Number of re-admissions	9
% of patients re-admitted	38%

11. Between 2018 and 2021 what percentage of your patients who access treatment for adult eating disorder services are male?

5.8%

12. Between 2018 and 2021 what percentage of your patients who access treatment for CAMHs eating disorder services are male?

This information is not held in a reportable format; therefore this request is refused under section 17 of FOISA.