

Question 1) How many private prescriptions have been paid for by the health board in a) 2017/18, b) 2018/19, c) 2019/20 and d) 2020 to date

NHS Dumfries and Galloway do not hold this information; therefore this request is refused under section 17 of FOISA

Question 2) What was the total cost of private prescriptions in a) 2017/18, b) 2018/19, c) 2019/20 and d) 2020 to date

NHS Dumfries and Galloway do not hold this information; therefore this request is refused under section 17 of FOISA

Question 3) What were the a) average, b) median and c) maximum costs of individual private prescriptions in a) 2017/18, b) 2018/19, c) 2019/20 and d) 2020 to date

NHS Dumfries and Galloway do not hold this information; therefore this request is refused under section 17 of FOISA